
$600,000 - Diamante Valley Mountain House, Perez
Zeledon
MLS® #costa_rica_21859 

$600,000
3 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 104 Sqm
Residential on 1.90 Sqm

Tinamastes, Perez Zeledon, San Jose

Nestled in the heart of Tinamastes, where the
gentle caress of warm breezes and year-round
sunshine create an idyllic setting, this property
invites you to embrace a life of outdoor
splendor and tranquility. Surrounded by the
lush tapestry of nature, with its verdant forests
and serene landscapes, this is a sanctuary
where you can truly connect with the rhythms
of the earth.At the heart of this haven lies a
cozy cabin, a charming retreat where comfort
meets rustic elegance. With its inviting warmth
and understated charm, it beckons you to
unwind and embrace the simple joys of life.
And when the urge for a refreshing dip strikes,
a sparkling swimming pool awaits, offering a
cool respite on balmy days.For those with a
penchant for adventure, the possibilities are
endless. Explore winding trails that lead
through lush forests, immerse yourself in the
vibrant tapestry of local wildlife, or simply lose
yourself in the art of gardening amidst the
verdant beauty that surrounds you.With
additional building sites waiting to be
discovered, the potential for expansion and
development is limited only by your
imagination. Whether you dream of creating a
family compound or seeking to capitalize on
the burgeoning rental market, the canvas is
yours to paint.Conveniently located just 25
minutes from both the bustling city of San
Isidro and the sun-kissed shores of the beach,
this property offers the perfect blend of



seclusion and accessibility. Whether you're
seeking a permanent residence, a weekend
retreat, or a savvy investment opportunity, this
is your chance to own a slice of paradise in
Costa Rica's enchanting countryside.

Essential Information

MLS® # costa_rica_21859

Price $600,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.00

Total Baths 3

Building Sqm 104

Lot Sqm 1.90

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Attached

Status Active

Community Information

Address Diamante Valley Mountain House

Subdivision Tinamastes

City Perez Zeledon

State San Jose

Postal Code 11909

Additional Information

Date Listed September 6th, 2024


