
$3,975,000 - Lavish Casa Jasmine At La Reserva,
Manuel Antonio
MLS® #costa_rica_20976 

$3,975,000
8 Bedroom, 9.00 Bathroom, 929 Sqm
MultiFamily on 0.00 Sqm

, Manuel Antonio, Puntarenas

Nestled amidst the lush jungles of Manuel
Antonio, Costa Rica, awaits an extraordinary
property radiating elegance and sophistication.
Welcome to your new haven in La Reserva, an
exclusive private residential enclave renowned
for its unmatched beauty and tranquility. This
magnificent estate, thoughtfully designed to
blend seamlessly with its natural surroundings,
promises an exceptional living experience with
luxurious accommodations.Spanning an
impressive 10,000 sq. ft. across three
expansive levels, this home boasts seven
spacious bedrooms, each with its own opulent
en-suite bathroom. Beyond the main living
quarters, the maid’s quarters offer a private
and comfortable space for household staff,
ensuring that every need is attended to with
the highest level of care and detail. Every
element of this residence has been
meticulously curated with premium fixtures and
stunning interior designs.A standout feature of
this estate is the indoor-outdoor gym, ideal for
maintaining an active lifestyle without leaving
the comfort of your home.The crown jewel of
this remarkable property is the grand infinity
pool. Overlooking the verdant jungle, this
tranquil oasis provides breathtaking views both
day and night. Whether hosting lively
gatherings or enjoying a peaceful evening
swim, the infinity pool, with its elegant
aquamarine hue, creates the perfect setting for
making unforgettable memories with friends



and family.La Reserva is not just a
neighborhood; it’s a community offering
top-tier security and exclusivity. With 24-hour
security, you can fully relax and savor your
surroundings with peace of mind. The
cobblestone streets and meticulously
maintained landscaping further enhance the
charm and sophistication of this prestigious
area.Living in La Reserva means embracing a
harmonious blend of luxury and nature. The
beautifully landscaped grounds complement
the jungle's natural beauty while being just 5
minutes away from the stunning Manuel
Antonio Beach. This idyllic setting provides a
sense of seclusion while remaining connected
to the vibrant life of Manuel Antonio.This rare
gem in La Reserva offers an unparalleled
lifestyle. It is not merely a house but a
sanctuary where luxury meets tranquility,
providing an exquisite backdrop for life’s most
treasured moments. Don’t miss the chance to
own this unique property in one of Costa
Rica’s most sought-after locations.

Essential Information

MLS® # costa_rica_20976

Price $3,975,000

Bedrooms 8

Bathrooms 8.5

Half Baths 1

Total Baths 9

Building Sqm 929

Lot Sqm 0.00

Type MultiFamily

Status Active

Community Information

Address Lavish Casa Jasmine At La Reserva

City Manuel Antonio

County Quepos



State Puntarenas

Postal Code 60601

Additional Information

Date Listed June 6th, 2024


