
$799,000 - Luxury Home With Ocean View, Ojochal
MLS® #costa_rica_15636 

$799,000
3 Bedroom, 4.00 Bathroom, 234 Sqm
Residential on 1011.00 Sqm

Chontales, Ojochal, Puntarenas

The epitome of luxury living in the exclusive
community of Chontales can be experienced in
this stunning 3-bedroom, 3.5-bathroom
residence. Situated in the heart of the village,
this contemporary sanctuary showcases
meticulous attention to detail and offers
breathtaking panoramic views of the Pacific
Ocean, Cano Island, Terraba River wetlands,
and the Osa Peninsula.Upon arrival at the
main entrance, a covered parking area greets
you, providing a picturesque vista of the
verdant forested mountains that envelop this
secure and esteemed neighborhood. The
house, constructed with modern solid
concrete, exemplifies both sophistication and
resilience.Inside, luxury abounds with exquisite
finishes, including hardwood doors, cabinetry,
and accents that exude an air of refined
opulence. The fully equipped chef's kitchen
features quartz countertops and top-of-the-line
stainless steel appliances, making it a haven
for culinary enthusiasts.

Essential Information

MLS® # costa_rica_15636

Price $799,000

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 3.5

Half Baths 1

Total Baths 4

Building Sqm 234



Lot Sqm 1,011.00

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Attached

Status Active

Community Information

Address Luxury Home With Ocean View

Subdivision Chontales

City Ojochal

County Osa

State Puntarenas

Postal Code 60501

Additional Information

Date Listed April 1st, 2024


