
$985,000 - Three Ocean View Villas, Perez Zeledon
MLS® #costa_rica_11037 

$985,000
6 Bedroom, 5.00 Bathroom, 
MultiFamily on 7122.00 Sqm

Tinamastes, Perez Zeledon, San Jose

Welcome to Villas Vista Mar, a captivating
estate nestled amidst the tranquil landscapes
of Tinamastes, Costa Rica. Spread across 1.7
acres of lush terrain, this remarkable property
features not one, but three enchanting houses,
offering a total of 6 bedrooms and 5
bathrooms.Immerse yourself in the
mesmerizing ocean views that stretch
endlessly towards the horizon, accompanied
by awe-inspiring views of majestic mountains
and lush valleys. Surrounded by verdant
foliage, the estate offers a sense of seclusion
and tranquility, inviting you to reconnect with
nature.Savor leisurely days by the infinity pool,
where the glistening waters merge seamlessly
with the azure skies. Entertain guests
effortlessly at the outdoor BBQ area, complete
with an invigorating outdoor shower for
refreshing dips beneath the sun-drenched
skies.Embrace an active lifestyle with your
very own outdoor gym, boasting panoramic
views of nature's beauty. Adorned with
flourishing fruit trees, the property exudes
tropical charm while providing an abundance
of fresh delights at your fingertips.Experience
the perfect blend of convenience and luxury
with private parking ensuring effortless access,
while the thoughtfully crafted layout ensures
that every corner of the estate is a haven of
comfort and relaxation.

Essential Information



MLS® # costa_rica_11037

Price $985,000

Bedrooms 6

Bathrooms 5.00

Total Baths 5

Lot Sqm 7,122.00

Type MultiFamily

Status Active

Community Information

Address Three Ocean View Villas

Subdivision Tinamastes

City Perez Zeledon

County PÃ©rez ZeledÃ³n

State San Jose

Postal Code 11909

Additional Information

Date Listed February 16th, 2024


