
$558,900 - Modern Home In The Heart Of Uvita,
Dominical
MLS® #costa_rica_10930 

$558,900
3 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 213 Sqm
Residential on 476.00 Sqm

Uvita, Dominical, Puntarenas

Escape to your dream destination nestled in
the heart of Uvita, Costa Rica – a hidden gem
that has captured the spotlight as 2024's top
travel pick. This picturesque property for sale
invites you to immerse yourself in the
tranquility and beauty that define this vibrant
tropical haven.Discover a remarkable
three-bedroom, two-bathroom house that goes
beyond mere accommodation, offering a
lifestyle immersed in nature's splendor.
Situated amidst Uvita's lush landscapes, this
residence is strategically located at the
epicenter of the town's cultural pulse.Step
inside this thoughtfully designed home, where
modern aesthetics meet comfort and
functionality. The open-plan layout seamlessly
connects the spacious living area to a sleek
kitchen adorned with quartz countertops and
elegant porcelain tiles, creating an inviting
space for relaxation and
entertainment.Outside, a serene pool with a
cascading waterfall beckons you to unwind in
style, offering a tranquil retreat amidst the buzz
of Uvita's bustling streets. The expansive
covered terrace, complete with a BBQ and
mini-kitchen, provides the perfect setting for
fresh dining and leisurely gatherings.Retreat to
the comfort of the generously sized bedrooms,
including a luxurious master suite with a
walk-in closet and ensuite bathroom, offering a
private sanctuary for rest and rejuvenation.
Whether you're considering a high-ROI rental



investment or seeking a permanent residence,
this property promises an unparalleled blend of
tranquility, culture, and adventure in Costa
Rica's breathtaking natural landscape.

Essential Information

MLS® # costa_rica_10930

Price $558,900

Bedrooms 3

Bathrooms 2.00

Total Baths 2

Building Sqm 213

Lot Sqm 476.00

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Attached

Status Active

Community Information

Address Modern Home In The Heart Of Uvita

Subdivision Uvita

City Dominical

County Osa

State Puntarenas

Postal Code 60504

Additional Information

Date Listed February 15th, 2024


